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The Persians: Lost Civilizations by Miko Flohr is a fascinating look at one of
the most ancient and influential civilizations in history. This book tells the
story of the Persian Empire, from its humble beginnings to its rise to power,
and finally to its decline and fall. Along the way, Flohr explores the culture,
religion, and art of the Persians, and he provides a vivid portrait of the
people who lived in this extraordinary civilization.
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The Persian Empire was founded in the 6th century BC by Cyrus the Great.
Cyrus was a brilliant military leader who conquered a vast territory that
stretched from the Indus River in the east to the Mediterranean Sea in the
west. The Persian Empire was one of the largest and most powerful
empires in the ancient world, and it lasted for over 200 years.
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The Persians were a sophisticated people who made significant
contributions to the world. They developed a system of writing, a system of
law, and a system of government. They were also skilled engineers and
architects, and they built some of the most impressive buildings in the
ancient world, including the Persepolis Palace and the Hanging Gardens of
Babylon.

The Persians were also a tolerant people who allowed their subjects to
practice their own religions. This tolerance helped to create a diverse and
cosmopolitan empire. The Persians were also patrons of the arts, and they
encouraged the development of painting, sculpture, and music.

The Persian Empire eventually declined and fell in the 4th century BC. The
empire was conquered by Alexander the Great, and it was later divided into
a number of smaller kingdoms. However, the legacy of the Persians lived
on. The Persians influenced the development of Western civilization, and
their culture continues to be studied and admired today.

The Persians: Lost Civilizations is a fascinating and informative book that
provides a comprehensive overview of one of the most important
civilizations in history. This book is a must-read for anyone who is
interested in ancient history, culture, or art.

Free Download Your Copy Today!

The Persians: Lost Civilizations is available now from all major booksellers.
Free Download your copy today and immerse yourself in the fascinating
world of the ancient Persians.
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